
 

Pinewood Infant School and Foundation Unit Sports Premium 2020/2021 

 

Sports Premium Allocations 
Total Sports Premium funding  £17,500 + £5700 underspend* 

£23,200 

Proposed spending £25,830 

Any additional money is supplemented by school budget  

 

School Priority Area Sport Premium  
Key Outcome/intention 

Implementation Cost Breakdown Impact Sustainability 

To improve teaching and 
learning in P.E 
Staff CPD. 
Increased confidence, 
knowledge and skills of all 
staff in teaching PE and 
sport. 
The engagement of all 
pupils in regular physical 
activity. 

Staff to feel confident in 
delivery of PE sessions in 
school. 
The profile of PE and 
sport is raised across the 
school as a tool for whole 
school improvement. 
All children regularly take 
part in physical exercise 
and are motivated. 
Increased participation in 
competitive sports. 
 

Employ PE specialist 
through Next Level Sports 
to work 1 day a week in 
school.   
Supporting staff in 
lessons. 
Developing schemes of 
work and lesson plans. 
Lunchtime activities. 
After school activities 
Supporting PE co-
ordinator with curriculum 
mapping. 
Develop assessment 
scheme. 

£5850 per annum 
 
 

Children to receive high 
quality PE lessons from a 
qualified coach which will 
impact on attainment at 
the end of KS1.  
 
Sessions were all 
observed to be 
good/outstanding and all 
children regularly 
engaged in physical 
activity in school 
 

Staff have observed and 
worked closely with a PE 
specialist have developed 
a scheme of work which 
can be used and built on 
in the future. 

To improve teaching and 
learning in P.E 
Staff CPD. 
 

A staff member receives 
training and a 
qualification to improve 
CPD. This will then be 
disseminated to staff 

Claire Reville to get a 
qualification in ‘Primary 
Physical Education 
specialism’ by attending a 
6 day training course. 

£1000 Staff are upskilled which 
will improve the overall 
delivery and leadership of 
PE within school 

A staff member has a 
certificate in primary 
physical education to 
ensure high quality 
teaching in PE if the 
funding for a coach ever 
ceases. 



Improve children’s fitness 
and encourage life-long 
healthy lifestyles. 
 

Children (with a focus on 
PP) are engaged in 
physical activity.  

Next Level Sports to run a 
holiday camp for a week 
in October half term, 
February and Easter. 

£1550 per week (based 
on £310 a day needing 3 
coaches if in bubbles, 
£220 a day for 2 coaches)  
£4650. 
 

Children explore a wide 
range of new and exciting 
sports such as dodgeball, 
football, dance, gym, 
fencing, scooters, 
basketball, cricket, tennis 
and laser tag. 

Children gained a lifelong 
love of sports and fitness. 

Improve children’s fitness 
and encourage life-long 
healthy lifestyles. 
To develop use of 
physical exercise as a 
method of supporting 
wellbeing. 

Children gain a deeper 
understanding of how to 
keep themselves healthy. 
 
 
 
 
 

The Life Bus to come into 
school in autumn term. 
 
FS1 and FS2 topic on 
keeping healthy. 
 
 
 

£ 600 (life bus for 2 days) 
Tam Charlton (no cost) 
 
Covid meant this was 
suspended 
 
 
 
 
 

Children have developed 
awareness and know how 
to keep themselves fit 
and healthy. Children are 
able to articulate this 
when asked. 
 

 

For children to feel 
confident using large 
scale equipment from a 
young age and to engage 
in risk taking. 

To improve our youngest 
children’s fine and gross 
motor skills with a 
particular focus on 
gripping strength across 
the EYFA. 

Build structures in F2 with 
a focus on gripping 
strength (ropes/climbing 
walls/frames). 

£2000 
 
 

Children who don’t make 
expected in Physical 
development at the end 
of F2 is mainly due to 
poor fine motor skills and 
we felt it has a lot to do 
with poor strength in 
children’s fingers. We 
want to improve this. 
 

The playground structure 
has been chosen for its 
sustainability. It has 
remained in place for 
future cohorts to access. 

To expose children to 
new sports and PE 
experiences and to 
encourage more pupils to 
take up sport through 
after school clubs. 
 

Children to experience a 
wide range of physical 
exercises.  

Superstar sports to run a 
‘spy club’ and a Football 
after school club. 
 
 
 
 
 
Next Level Sports to run a 
Multiskills club weekly 

£1365 for spy club & 
£1365 for football club 
(based on 39 weeks of 
coaching at £35 per 
session). 
 
 
 
Included in the 1.5 days 
of the coach’s time 

Children to experience a 
broader range of sports 
which are not part of the 
curriculum with the 
intention of improving 
fitness and interest in 
sports. 

Links made with external 
coaches. 



To ensure that children 
have the best equipment 
to achieve the best 
possible outcomes. 

Children to have the best 
opportunity to succeed in 
physical education. 

Discussion with PE coach 
about what equipment 
needs replacing or 
purchasing/Assessment 
by Sportsafe. 
 

£1000 
 

School is well equipped to 
teach PE to the highest 
standard. 

Equipment has been  
replaced as instructed by 
Sports Safe. 

Children to be physically 
active throughout 
playtimes and lunchtimes. 
To develop use of 
physical exercise as a 
method of supporting 
wellbeing, to let of steam 
during their free play 
times. 

All children regularly take 
part in physical exercise. 
To improve children’s 
fitness levels. 

Trim trail in the outdoor 
area to be replaced with 
structures which 
encourage getting the 
heart rate up and physical 
strength. 

£8,000 Not completed 
due to COVID 

Children are active during 
playtime and lunchtime 
with equipment that 
encourages improving 
physical strength. 

 

 


